FOI Request Response information

FOI request reference: 2015/063

Date request received: 17/03/2015

Date request responded to: 16/04/2015

Category: Workforce

Tags: Ethnicity, disciplinary, training

Request Detail:

Ethnicity info relating to disciplinary and training

| am interested in broadly grouped data for “Black”, “Asian” and “White” based on
broad groupings of the categories used in the Electronic Staff Records (ESR). An
example of how this can be done can be seen in this table from the HSCIC -
http://www.hscic.gov.uk/catalogue/PUB13951/nhs-work-stat-oct-2013-equal-div.xIs
Please also include figures for “Total Headcount” of staff and any other ethnic groups
under “Other” for completeness.

Please can you provide the following data for the period 2010-2015 (or as far back
as possible in the range) by these broad ethnic groups:

Data on the disciplinary process:
Number and percentage of disciplinaries
What are the main reasons for disciplinaries
Outcomes of disciplinaries
Number and percentages of dismissals

Data on staff accessing non mandatory training and Continuous Professional
Development (CPD):

Percentages and numbers days training received

Broken down by categories of training received (if possible)

Your Trust’s staff survey data on bullying, harassment, career progression and
overall discrimination

Response Detail:

The Trust response to your recent FOI request in the attached excel documents.
Please note for the response to your first question the Trust is only able to supply
information for 2014-2015 as the data was not been held centrally prior to this date
and would require a significant amount of time to get the data from multiple sources.

Please click on the paperclip symbol, on the left hand toolbar, to see additional

attachments.



http://www.hscic.gov.uk/catalogue/PUB13951/nhs-work-stat-oct-2013-equal-div.xls


FOI Request - Disciplinaries and Training 2014-2015

Number and percentage of disciplinaries Total Number (182) |Percentage
Black 4 2%
Asian 18 10%
Undefined / not stated 12 6.5%
Other 1 0.5%
White 147 81%
Bullying and Other / Inappropriate
Main reasons for disciplinaries Misconduct Attendance Timekeeping [Harassment Discrimination Jjunknown relationship
Black 3
Asian 16 1
Unknown / not stated 10
Other 1
White 127 1 4 2 1
Final written  |First written No further Not yet
Outcome of disciplinaries Dismissal warning warning Informal action |action concluded [Not recorded
Black 1 1 1
Asian 3 1 4 7
Unknown / not stated 1 1 2 3 5
Other
White 8 11 17 28 69
Number and percentage of dismissals Total Number (13) Percentage
Black 1 8.0%
Asian 3 23.0%
Unknown / not stated 1 8.0%
Other
White 8 61.0%






Public Confidentiality JFalsification |Eligibility
complaints Jissues of records |to work







CPD-Apply-CustomReport

Gender
Female

Male

Male
Male
Male
Female
Female
Female
Male
Female
Female
Male
Female
Female
Male
Male
Female
Female
Female
Female
Male
Female
Male
Female

Ethnicity

Black or Black British - Any Other Black background
| do not wish to disclose

Black or Black British - Any Other Black background
White - British

other Ethnic Group - Any other ethnic group - please state:
Mixed - White &amp; Asian

White - Any other white background

other Ethnic Group - Any other ethnic group - please state:
Asian or Asian British - Pakistani

Asian or Asian British - Any other Asian Background
| do not wish to disclose

Mixed - White &amp; Asian

Mixed - Any other mixed background

Black or Black British - African

Black or Black British - Caribbean

Black or Black British - African

Asian or Asian British - Indian

White - Irish

White - Irish

White - Any other white background

Asian or Asian British - Indian

| do not wish to disclose

&nbsp;

&nbsp;

White - British

White - British

Total

This is an external database and as such does not record or able to
report on the number of total training days. Some modules on

CPD are 12 days duration, some only a few days. So for the

purposes of this report we have averaged 5 days per module.

Count
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135
188
1001
1459

0.069%
0.069%
0.069%
0.069%
0.069%
0.069%
0.137%
0.137%
0.137%
0.137%
0.206%
0.274%
0.411%
0.411%
0.411%
0.411%
0.48%
0.48%
0.548%
0.548%
0.685%
0.891%
2.536%
9.253%
12.886%
68.609%

Estimated CPD training

days = 7295






NON MANDATORY ATTENDANCE DAYS

| Ethnicity Total Days |Percentage
0 White 107 0.038%
A White - British 248673 87.349%
B White - Irish 2385.5 0.838%
C White - Any other White background 2520.5 0.885%
CA White English 199.5 0.07%
CB White Scottish 72 0.025%
CFWhite Greek 12 0.004%
CP White Polish 21 0.007%
CX White Mixed 186.5 0.066%
CY White Other European 435.5 0.153%
D Mixed - White & Black Caribbean 373 0.131%
E Mixed - White & Black African 297 0.104%
F Mixed - White & Asian 571 0.201%
G Mixed - Any other mixed background 534 0.188%
H Asian or Asian British - Indian 7046 2.475%
J Asian or Asian British - Pakistani 4185.5 1.47%
K Asian or Asian British - Bangladeshi 386 0.136%
L Asian or Asian British - Any other Asian background 895.5 0.315%
LH Asian British 74 0.026%
LK Asian Unspecified 16 0.006%
M Black or Black British - Caribbean 1269 0.446%
N Black or Black British - African 4151 1.458%
P Black or Black British - Any other Black background 75.5 0.027%
PC Black Nigerian 192 0.067%
PD Black British 189.5 0.067%
PE Black Unspecified 180 0.063%
R Chinese 556 0.195%
S Any Other Ethnic Group 441 0.155%
SC Filipino 28 0.01%
SE Other Specified 5 0.002%
Undefined 178 0.063%
Z Not Stated 8434.5 2.963%

| Total Days Training

284690





